
To: 
From: ns op er 
Sent Sun 3/29/2015 11:09:07 PM 
Subject Re: Jeffrey Epstein 

On Mar 5, 2015, at 12:48 PM, wrote: 

Hi Christopher. Merwin says he has delivered the check and has the print and doc in 
hand! Thank you. We have stopped payment on the other check. I don't think it 
will come to you, but if it does, you can rip it up. Might you be able to send me a 
copy of the doc via email? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 5, 2015, at 8:16 AM, Christopher Anderson 
wrote: 

Is not as complicated as it sounds. Just trying to be very recise. If a driver comes 
to the they will be 
directed in. 

Yes, I can hand over print and letter then. I won't be into my studio until about 
1030 or even 11 

Chris 

CHRISTOPHER ANDERSON 
www.christophcrandersonphoto.com 
MAGNUM PHOTOS 

On Mar 5, 2015, at 8:03 AM 
wrote: 

OH MY! yes, that sounds complicated...but I am going to send Jeffrey's 
driver to you ...it will be either Jojo or Leo (or maybe 
both so they can decipher the directions!) I will get them 
your phone number in case they need to call you...would 
it be easier to just hand them the photo and the letter 
today as well? then you don't have to send... 

On Mar 5, 2015, at 8:01 AM, Christopher 
Anderson wrote: 
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Would be best to messenger to my studio: 

Me 

Use my phone number. Special instructions are that delivery should use 
back entrance at elevator 60 

GPS coordinates a 

Sorry that sounds really complicated but is big complex 
and that Info is helpful for messenger 

Thanks so much! 

CHRISTOPHER ANDERSON 
www.christopherandersonphoto.com 
MAGNUM PHOTOS 

On Mar 5 2015 at 7:51 AM, 

wrote: 

Christopher, I see the problem...the check was sent to the wrong 
apt number. Do you have a 
door man or will you be home 
today? I am going to have a new 
check messengered to you... 

On Mar 5, 2015, at 
7:42 AM, 
Christopher 
Anderson 

aote:liM 
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Good morning. I was going to write you. I have not 
received a check. If 
it went out Friday 
then it seems like it 
is taking too much 
time in the mail. If 
it doesn't come 
today then I would 
say something is 
definitely amiss. 

To double check address: 

As soon as I receive the check I will send the print and 
letter (which was 
printed yesterday!) 

CHRISTOPHER ANDERSON 
www.christopherandersonphoto.com 
MAGNUM PHOTOS 

on 
Mar 5, 
2015, 
at 7:21 
AM, 

wrote: 

Good morning Christopher. Thought I would check 
in...did 
you 
receive 
the 
check 
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from 
Jeffrey 
9 
When 

did you 
think 
you 
will 
send 
the 
ackno 
wledg 
ment 
letter 
and 
print of 
Mr. 
Rcdfor 
d? 

Hope you are enjoying yet more snow! 

On Mar 2, 2015 at 12:12 PM Christopher 
Anderson wrote: 

HeIle Lesley, 
thank you for this. 
I will get the print made and the written 
acknowledgment put together to be sent. I 
will probably send by either fedex or UPS. 
Will let you know when I am sending. Just to 
warn that it will take a few days to get the 
print made. 

all best, 
Chris 

On Mar 2 2015 at 10:34 AM. 
wrote: 

Good morning Christopher. Hope you 
had a great weekend. Wanted to let 
you know you should receive the check 
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from Jeffrey early this week...it was 
sent in Friday's mail to you....Jeffrey 
would like you to send the one Robert 
Redford photo and an acknowledgment 
of the ownership of all the photos taken 
to him at his home: 

9 East 71st Street 
New York, New York 10021 

Please let me know when you will send 
the above out and by what means (Fed 
Ex, messenger, etc?) 

Tia.s9cou, 

Assistant to Jeffrey Epstein 
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