
To: 
Cc: r echMe Jeffrey 
E.Ueevacation@gmail.com] 
From: Richard Joslin 
Sent: Fri 3/27/2015 3:14:04 PM 
Subject: RE: 

Richard Kah 

Samantha is not able to be in NYC on Monday as she is in NJ office of Untracht 
Early. I will look to see when she can be in our office next and coordinate with 

Thanks 

 Original Messa e 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Friday, Marc 
To: Richard Joslin 
Cc: Lesley Groff 
Subject: Re: 

i am too busy today to meet Samantha however Jeffrey would like to Skype with her 
today at 1pm from your office please arrange thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel= 
fax 
cel 

> On Mar 27, 2015, at 10:49 AM, Richard Joslin wrote: 

> • Are you able to meet with Samantha today - I have not yet cancelled. Thanks 
for your help. 

• Original Messa e 
> From: Richard Kahn 
> Sent: Friday, March 2 , 1 1 :4 AM 
> To: Richard Joslin 
> Subject: 

> • i am reviewing your education invoice and it appears that there was a 
> march 13th payment due in the amount of 5,000 i assume you paid and 
> outstanding balance is 53,000 please confirm thank you 

> Richard Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 
> 575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
> New, 
> tel 
> fa 
> cel 
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