To: Rich Joslin

From:
Sent: Fri 3/27/2015 3:48:00 PM
Subject: Re:

good deal. thanks

On Mar 27, 2015, at 11:47 AM, Richard Joslin <|| | - Vot

| am working with Ava on setting up a skype account on my laptop. | will revert once it is

set up,

From
Sent: Friday, March 27, 2015 11:46 AM
To: Richard Joslin
Cc: Brad Wechsler; leffrey Epstein; Rich Kahn
Subject:

Excellent. . her Skype address?
Jeffrey's Skype address i1s: jeevacation

On Mar 27, 2015, at 11:44 AM, Richard Joslin < ||| G v ote:

She can be in our offices today for a Skype with JEE at 1pm

From: Brad Wechsler [mailto:
Sent: Friday, March 27, 2015 11:43 AM
To: 'jeevacation@gmail.com": Richard Joslin
Subject: Re:

| would think it shld. Rich?

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jesvacation@amail.com]
Sent: Friday, March 27, 2015 11:35 AM
To: Richard Joslin <} - ; 5-ad Wechsler
Subject: Re:

Brad does not today work for Skype

On Friday, March 27, 2015, Richard Joslin <|} - v ot<:

Samantha is not able to be in NYC on Monday as she is in NJ office
of Untracht Early. I will look to see when she can be in our office

next and coordinate with [l Thanks
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Sent: Friday, March 27, 2015 11:00 AM
To: Richard Joslin

Ce:

Subject: Re:

1 am too busy today to meet Samantha however Jefrey would like to Skype with
her today at 1pm from your office please arrange thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel
fa:
cel

> On Mar 27, 2015, at 10:49 AM. Richard Joslin _ wrote:

e

> Are you able to meet with Samantha today - | have not yet cancelled. Thanks for
your help.

= ———-Onginal Message-----

> From: Richard Kahn [mailto

= Sent: Friday, March 27, 2015 10:47 AM

= To: Richard Joslin

> Subject:

=1 am reviewing your education invoice and it appears that there was a
> march 13th payment due in the amount of 5,000 i assume you paid and
= outstanding balance is 53,000 please confirm thank you

= Richard Kahn

> HBRK Associates Inc.

= 575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor

= New York, NY 10022

= tel
= fa
= cel
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please note

The information contained in this communication is

confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 15 the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@'gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

IMANE is a registerad trademark of IMAX Corporation

Wiaw.imax.com

AROERTANT N T B e rret s srrhe rrre et

Infermation contained in this e-mail correspondence and any attachments is confidential information intended ondy for the

usd of the individual or entity named above

Amy reader of this message who is not the intended recipient of this comespondence s ereby n otified that any

dissamination, distribution, copying

of carmmunication of the comtents of this comespondence is sir ctly prohibited f this e-mail was not addressed o wou

please immediately notify us

by phone in Canada at (305) 403-8500 (collect calls will be accepted) or by email at webmaster@imax.com and delete and

destroy this
cormespandence inadvertently sent ta you, Thank you
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