
To: 
Cc: 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Sat 3/21/2015 1:28:29 PM 
Subject Re: Credit Card._ 

thanks 
On Mar 20, 2015, at 4:29 PM, bellaklein < > wrote: 

> Les, has her personal debit card. She will use it indwell get 
reimbursed. Amex was for :)) 

> • Thank you, 
> Bella 

> Tel: 

» On Mar 20, 2015, at 4:26 PM, Lesley Groff > wrote: 

>> so that doesnt work... 
you will need to use Jeffrey's Amex then...I will send you his details in 

2 separate emails...if the restaurant needs an actual card to swipe, you will have 
to ask Jeffrey for his card... 
>> 
» On Mar 20, 2015, at 4:05 PM, bellaklein < > wrote: 

>» Amex reached the limit. Her Amex will start working on April 11th. 
>» 
>» Thank you, 
>» Bella 

>>> 
>» Tel: 
>» 
>» 
>>» On Mar 20, 2015, at 3:51 PM, Lesley Groff > wrote: 
>>» 
>>>> , you do have a credit card that you can charge the dinner to this 
Monday, yes? 
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