
To: Lesley Grofa 
Cc: Rich Kahn( 
From: bellaklein 
Sent: We / 1 1:50:43 PM 
Subject: Re: school tuition 

ok 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

> On Mar 25, 2015, at 9:49 AM, Lesley Groff < > wrote: 

> ok good deal...you have her instructions in another emial I sent you...and 
please read what Jeffrey typed to her as well because he says he will give her 
money and pay for books... 

> On Mar 25, 2015, at 9:47 AM, bellaklein > wrote: 

>> She called yesterday and asked if we can wire money to her account and she 
will pay the school. I answered that i have instructions to pay the school 
directly. She had a problem to find a statement online and told that she will 
request statement from the office. 
>> 
» Thank you, 
>> Bella 

» Tel: 

>>> On Mar 25, 2015, at 9:26 AM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 
>>> 
>» We never received any info nor were we aware we were supposed to reach out. 
>>> 
>» Sent from my iPhone 
>» 
>>>> On Mar 25, 2015, at 9:01 AM, Lesley Groff < wrote: 
>>» 
>>» IIII is coming to see Jeffrey today at 1pm Have yall reached out to her or 
did she contact you yet re her school tuition? I just think je may speak to her 
about it 
>>» 
»» 
>>» 
>>» 
>>» Sent from my iPhone 
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