
To: Bella Klei 
Cc: Richard Kahn 
From: 
Sent Thur 315120151:32:44 PM 
Subject Re: Christopher Anderson -Send Check for $20,000 

thanks 
On Mar 5, 2015, at 8:26 AM, bellaklein wrote: 

Ok, I will stop payment and reissue check, will let you know when it is ready to go 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Mar 5, 2015, at 7:50 AM, wrote: 

Bella, below address is incorrect! the apartment # is Not 
in (I remember my computer stalling when inputting his address 
into my contacts and I think when I tried to retype, it accepted all the 
numbers instead of just the  This check is HIGH PRIORITY to 
Jeffrey (probably should have been fed ex'd or messengered in the 
first place) Please write a new check and have it messengered to 
Christopher first thing today! (stop payment on the other 
check)...once Christopher receives this check he will then forward the 
documents Jeffrey is waiting for!! Please confirm back...thanks 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Christopher Anderson -Send Check for 
$20,000 
Date: February 27 2015 at 3:04:51 PM EST 
To: Rich Kahn 

Jeffrey would like you to send Christopher Anderson with Christopher 
Anderson Photography Inc. $20,000. 

Christopher Anderson 

(he just took several photos of Jeffrey here at the house for the NY Magazine 
article that will be coming out by Michael Wolff) 
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