To:

Cc: |; Daphne Wallace
From: bellaklein

Sent: Mon 2/2/2015 8:13:51 PM

Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein

It was the billing cost, not what we actually paid after adjustment..
Thank you,
Bella

On Feb 2, 2015, at 3:11 F[‘x-‘]_u-'mtu:

That 18 because we had a credit for a machine that Jeffrey returned.

Sent from my iPhone

Attached please find prior invoice. We paid for $4084 97
<SKM (C284¢14121514180 pdf=

Thank you,
Bella

wirote:

Ok for me to order? Shall I have Bella pay for it?

Sent from my iPhone

wrote:

EFTA_R1_00674238
EFTA02085376



is that same price we paid last time?
more? less?
thanks

Richard Kahn

HBRE Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
g r r "_}

Begin forwarded message:

Date: February 2, 2015 at
1:23:57 PM EST
Subject: Fwd: Jeffrey
Epstein

From: Daphne Wallace

To: Rich Kahn

—————————— Forwarded message —--oaoeeoo
From: Carlos Vazquez
Date: Mon, Feb 2, 2015 at 1:22 PM
Subject: RE: Jeffrey Epstein

To:

Carlos Vazquez

Cc: Daphne Wallace

The picce is 4499.00 with bench and leg extension. I can sell it to
you for 3799.00 plus 100 drop
charge, Let me know when your
ready and I will order
asap....thanks
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To: Carlos Vazquez
Ce: Daphne Wallace
Subject: Jeffrey Epstem

Hello Carlos. Jeftfrey would like to order the same Inspire Fitness machine
he has in PB for his island (reminder:
this 15 the second one we ordered with
the leg exiension) Can you please let
me know your BEST discounted
price? We will need to have it
delivered 1o Tropical
Shipping. .. Daphne can discuss with
vou the procedures. It is important
that the invoice be done a certain way
for cusioms. Daphne is ced here and
works at Jellrev's oflice on SI.
Thomas.

Look forward to hearing back from you.

Thank you.
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