Pida, Michael
From: Ericson, Chrisiine
Sent: Tue 1/13/2015 3:21:07 PM

Subject: RE: CO and funds on deposit

Once the final inspection has been received, the Bank will release the present hold that is on your
account. The modification has been approved and | am waiting for the title search to be returned. The
anticipated return date is this coming Friday. Upon its return, | will contact you to schedule a date and

time to execute the modification documents,

Thank you

Chris Ericson

Christine M. Ericson

Vice President Retail Lending

Bankwell Bank
855 Main S5t

Bridgeport, CT 06604

Sent: Tuesday, January 13, :

To: Ericson, Christine
Cc: Pida, Michael: Ike Groff
Subject: Re: CO and funds on deposit

Hello Chris. Joan Brown from the bank came yesterday moming and had a look at the house.
Please let me know what our next steps are. Thanks,_

On Dec 31, 2014, at 9:21 AM. Ericson, Christine _wrmc:
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| will have the Bank's appraiser contact you regarding the final inspection and to schedule it for next
week with you. When you go to Bankwell in New Canaan, have them make a copy of the CO and send
the copy to my attention to the Bridgeport Office.

Thank you and have a Happy and Safe New Year

Chris

Christine M. Ericson

Vice President Retail Lending

Bankwell Bank

855 Main St

Bridgeport, CT 06604

Sent: nesday, ember 31, :

To: Ericson, Christine
Cc: Pida, Michael; Ike Groff
Subject: Re: CO and funds on deposit

Good morning Chris.__you may speak with me about a final inspection. . I will bring in the CO
today to Bankwell in New Canaan.. would you like to schedule final inspection for one day next
week?

On Dec 31, 2014, at 7:57 AM, Ericson, Christine _ wrote:
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The Bank will also need to arrange to have a final inspection completed by the Banks appraiser. Please
let me know who they should contact and a contact number.

Thank you

Chris Ericson

Christine M. Ericson

Vice President Retail Lending

Bankwell Bank

855 Main 5t

Bridgeport, CT 06604

From: Pida, Michael
Sent: Tuesday, December 30, 2014 4:23 PM
To: Ike Groff
Ericson, Christine
Subject: RE: CO and funds on deposit

Hi lke,

| believe that is the case. | am out of the office until Monday but please forward the CO or drop off and
we will work it out.

Best-Mike

You have my commitment
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Michael J. Pida

V.P. Sales Manager

mpida@mybankwell.com

www.mybankwell.com

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and are intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to whom this email is addressed. If you are not one of the named recipients or have
reason to believe that you have received this message in error, please notify me at the phone number or
email address listed above. Please delete this message and all its attachments from your computer.

Any other use, retention, dissemination, forwarding, printing, or copying of this email by unauthorized
recipients is strictly prohibited. This email and any files transmitted with it may contain nonpublic
personal information about consumers subject to the restrictions of the Gramm-Leach-Bliley Act. You
may not directly or indirectly reuse or re-disclose such information for any purpose other than to
provide the services for which you are receiving the information.

Sent: Tuesday, December 30, 2014 4:06 PM
To: Pida, Michael

< A
Su '

Yes we have that, we will get it to you

What | did not realize you were holding funds.

- can you get this over to the bank?

EFTA_R1_00676454
EFTA02086489



From: Pida, Michael [mailto:mpida@myvbankwell.com]
Sent: Tuesday, December 30, 2014 4:03 PM

To: ke Groff

Subject: CO and funds on deposit

Hi lke,

| hope you are well. Have you received the final C/O on your property yet? We are holding funds |
believe awaiting completion and Underwriter is wondering when that will occur.

Let me know when you can.
Happy New Year

Thanks-Mike

You have my camrmitment

Michael J. Pida

V.P. 5ales Manager

mpida@mybankwell.com

wawrw. mybankwell.com

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and are intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to whom this email is addressed. If you are not one of the named recipients or have
reason to believe that you have received this message in error, please notify me at the phone number or
email address listed above. Please delete this message and all its attachments from your computer.
Any other use, retention, dissemination, forwarding, printing, or copying of this email by unauthorized
recipients is strictly prohibited. This email and any files transmitted with it may contain nonpublic
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personal information about consumers subject to the restrictions of the Gramm-Leach-Bliley Act. You
may not directly or indirectly reuse or re-disclose such information for any purpose other than to
provide the services for which you are receiving the information.

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended only for the person or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the
intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this e-mall and any attachment{s) is stricthy
prohibited. If you have recelved this e-mall in error please immediately notify the sender at 203-302-7300 or by replying to this e-mall and delete
the e-mail and any attachment(s] from your system. Mothing herein shall be construed as a financial promotion to any person or persons, or a
solicitation or recommmendation to buy or sell any security or other investment or to engage in any trading strategy. Information presented is from
sources believed to be reliable, but is not guaranteed to be accurate or complete, This information should not be taken as an offer nor as a
solicitation of an offer to buy or sell securities or other financial instruments. Email transmission cannot be guaranteed to be secure, timely or

error free. Tourmaline Partners, LLC may review and store both incoming and outgoing messages. Use by other than the intended reciplents is
prohibited.
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