To:
Cc: Bella Klei

From: Lesley Groff
Sent: Mon 12/22/2014 2:01:36 PM
Subject: Re: Haircut w/Patrick Monday Dec. 22 at 1:30

I have paid for your cut. .. Your appointment 15 under JEFFREY EPSTEIN's name!. ..
Bella, as soon as | have receipt | will forward to you...

On Dec 19, 2014, at 8:22 PM, |, - o<

Perfect!

On Friday, December 19, 2014, Lesley Groff _ wrote:
Hi-. you will see Patrick on Monday dEc. 22 at 1:30pm.. .they request
you arrive at 1:15....1 will call and pay for the appointment that morning. ..

Please confirm back ;)

Henri Bendel
714 5th Ave. (btn 55th & 56th), 4th floor
MNew York NY 10022

On Dec 19, 2014, at 6:26 PM, ||| G o -

Thank you!

On Friday, December 19, 2014, Lesley Gl'ﬂﬂ"-‘-‘_‘? wrote:

will do!
[ will try for Monday afternoon...

On Dec 19, 2014, at 6:10 PM, _-* wrote:

= Hi Lesley! Could I have haircut appointment? Thank vou!
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