
To: 
From: 
Sent Wed 12/17/2014 8:07:30 PM 
Subject Re: Amex-Charles hotel double booked. 

Hi Les, 
Do you have a cost backup for Charles hotel. Below is charges to the card. Please confirm. 

12/03/2014 CHARLES HOTEL CAMBRIDGE MA 296.42JE Boston 
12/03/2014 CHARLES HOTEL CAMBRIDGE MA 868.67JE Boston 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Nov 28, 2014, at 1:46 PM, wrote: 

it is a duplicate reservation...I have cancelled one! 

On Nov 28, 2014, at 11:20 AM, bellaklein wrote: 

Amex called that today is the last day to cancel if it is double booked. -
2 same rooms... 

Thank you, 

Bela 
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