
To: James Ce 
Cc: Bella 
From: Lesley Gro 
Sent Tue 1/13/201510:58:27 PM 
Subject Re: Your receipt from Apple Store, Stamford 

perfect! I will let Jeffrey know you arc coming as well (I have seen the emails between you and 
Rich as well :) 
On Jan 13, 2015, at 5:20 PM, fames ce I personal genius wrote: 

I'm booked on Thursday but available Friday AM. Does IOAM work? 

James Ce 
your Personal Genius 

Certified Support Professional 10.6 

http://oersonalgenius.us 

On Jan 13, 2015, at 4:39 PM, Lesley Groff 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

wrote: 

Also, James...I will be at Jeffrey's house this Thursday and 
Friday...might it be possible for you to transfer my phone to the new 
Iphone 6? (I couldn't take the 6 Plus...it was just too big...!) 
On Jan 13, 2015, at 4:25 PM, bellaklei 
wrote: 

i would cancel, James your opinion? 

On Jan 13, 2015, at 4:22 PM, Lesley Groff 
wrote: 

I thought we always bought apple care? or maybe that is just for 
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computers? I don't have to...i don't 
care...its for if you have a problem with your 
phone its fixed free...its like insurance right? 
spend $99 now to save in the ffiture...but 
you tell me ..if you want me to cancel it, I'll 
cancel it... 

On Jan 13, 2015, at 4:20 PM, bellaklein 
wrote: 

ok, why did you need Apple 
care? 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tc 

On Jan 13, 2015, at 
4:17 PM, Lesley 

gtri> wrote: 

I purchased on my own CC...they had to run threw the 
machine...I will 
submit for 
reimbursement with 
other receipts next 
week ....thanks for 
your help today and 
sorry this is 
annoying! I know i 
will be MUCH 
happier with the 
Iphone 6... :) Les 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
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e 
ct: 
Your 
receip 
t from 
Apple 
Store, 
Stamf 
ord 
Date: 
Janua 
ry 13, 
2015 
at 
1 19 4 
7 PM 
EST • 
Cc: 

Reply-
To: 

Thank you for shopping at the Apple Store. 

To tell us about your experience, click here. 
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