
Sent Tue 12/30/2014 7:45:40 PM 
Subject Re: FT2 for Jeffrey Epstein 

Thank you and Happy New Year, 

Bella 

On Dec 30, 2014, at 2:39 PM, Carlos Vazquez wrote: 

Hello, 

The balance was processed and I was able to pull from another order. I have you set up 
for delivery this Friday. You will receive a call for your delivery window prior thanks 

Carlos Vazquez 
President Busy Body Gyms To Go/ 
Busy Body Fitness Centers & Prospot Distribution 

From: bellaklein [bklein575@gmaiLoarn]
Sent: Tuesday, December 30, 2014 10:28 AM 
To: Carlos Vazquez 
Cc: Lesley Groff; Rich Kahn; corryeuvmstoao.com 
Subject: Re: FT2 for Jeffrey Epstein 

Hello Carlos/Corry, 

Attached please find Credit Card authorization form. Please email payment receipt and 
please confirm delivery. 

Thank you, 
Bella 
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On Dec 30, 2014, at 10:01 AM, Carlos Vazquez wrote: 

Ok, 
Please see attached credit card authorization form or you may wire as 
before thanks. The balance is 2586.37 

regards 

Carlos Vazquez 
carlosOnymst000.com 
President/CEO of Busy Body Gyms To Go/ 
Busy Body Fitness Center Palm Beach 
Gardens & Prospot Distribution 

On Dec 30, 2014, at 9:54 AM, la wrote: 

Jeffrey most defiantly wants the new FT24).so sorry, I 
thought it had been paid*.can you please order ASAP 
and let me know the timing? 

On Dec 30, 2014, at 9:42 AM, Carlos Vazquez •c 
wrote: 

Hello Lesley, 
I hope you had a great Christmas as well! 

I never heard back from you to confirm he wanted the FT2. I sent you 
the new invoice/quote on 12/15 but nothing 
was ever sent back? I can see what I can do, 
but I have paid in full orders ahead Mr. 
Epstein currently Please let me know 
ASAP... 

kind regards, 

Carlos Vazquez 
carlos@avmstoeo.com 
President/CEO of Busy Body Gyms To 
Go/ 
Busy Body Fitness Center Palm Beach 
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Gardens & Prospot Distribution 

On Dec 30, 2014, at 9:19 AM, =f wrote: 

Hello Carlos. Hope you had a 
nice Christmas•.just checking 
in O.do you think the Inspire 
FT2 will be in soon? 

Thanks, 

<Credit Card Authorization[1]-1.doc> 
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