
To: 
From: 
Sent Tue 11/18/2014 8:38:01 PM 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein 

Dear Lesley, 
I just wanted to let you know that I have booked the ticket, but, that the ticket has not yet been 
processed. (This as I booked it through a Swedish booking agency just before closing time. I do, 
however, have the booking reference). I get back to you tomorrow again. 
Have a good afternoon and evening. 
Also, THANK you very much fix all your help, 

On Tue, Nov 18, 2014 at 4:53 PM, Lesley Groff •,: > wrote: 

great :) 
On Nov 18, 2014, at 10:40 AM, 
<ckv2101(a columbia.edu> wrote: 

DeR Lesley, 
THANK YOU so very very very much. I am speechless! 
I get back to you shortly! 
Cccilis 

On Tuesday, November 18, 2014, Lesley Groff wrote: 

..I am still on the other line but wanted to get back to you ASAP! 
Jeffrey would like you to book the trip for $3800!!! :) 

YAE! so book your trip and please send me the invoice so Rich can wire you the 
money... 

Thanks, Lesley 
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