
To: tS ones Stone 
From: 
Sent: Wed 10/8/2014 2:41:07 PM 
Subject: Re: Estimate from Stepping Stones Marble & Granite LW 

thanks! will get back to you! (that was a lot quicker than you thought to get 
back to me ;) 
On Oct 8, 2014, at 10:35 AM, Vicki Beltz wrote: 

> Hi 

> Attached is the estimate you have requested. If you would like to move 
forward, I will need to take payment in full. Let me know if you have any 
questions. All of the material is in-stock so it will take about one week to 
receive everything. 

> Thanks, 
> Vicki 
> <Est_3444_from_Stepping_Stones_MG_LLC_9144.pdf> 
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