
To: Bella Klein 
From: 
Sent: Tue 10/14/2014 2:07:38 PM 
Subject: Re: Fedex 

Yes, we sent a fed ex to Dr. Merkin in CA....Jeffrey's MRI's of his back... 

On Oct 14, 2014, at 10:05 AM, bellaklein < wrote: 

> Please confirm attached fedex invoice. Les, is fedex to CA JE charge? 
> <AmexGold_Fedex pdf> 
> Thank you, 
> Bella 
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