
To: 
From: bellaklein 
Sent Fri 10/24/2014 7:13:34 PM 
Subject: Re: Paris... 

thank you El I ordered international serves for 8120 each phone and can cancel 
after effective day, that is tomorrow... What can we do.... 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On Oct 24, 2014, at 3:10 PM, wrote: 

is here...she says she does not know if she will be going to paris as of 
quite frankly, Jeffrey has not given Larry the go ahead on this trip! 

It is possible the trip is delayed until Monday (the pilot Larry needs to help 
fly with him is not available until Monday) 

> Basically everything is still up in the air! 

> (and sorry...I have an office full of people and 2 other calls on hold when you 
rang!) 

> :) still on the phone now even! 
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