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From: obert Caffrey

Sent: Sun 10/12/2014 12:01:40 PM
Subject: RE: Estimate from Stepping Stones Marble & Granite LLC

Don't know

From:

Sent: Saturday, October 11, 2014 6:28 PM

To: Bob Caffrey

Cc: Ike Groff

Subject: Re: Estimate from Stepping Stones Marble & Granite LLC

I checked the attic. ..l see no 2x2 tiles left over of anything...odd..there are lots of subway tiles
from ty’s bath and the basement bath along with the bigger tiles...but zero 2x2’s...why would
that be? ’

On Oct 10, 2014, at 6:00 PM, Robert Cafirey <IN .ot

Carrera marble is very standard. Very popular. But it's a stone and they vary. | will see Tuesday if she
will give us wholesale price. 800 dollars for two shower floors and one of them is tile. Little pricey.

From:

Sent: Friday, October 10, 2014 10:07 AM

To: Bob Caffrey

Cc: Ike Groff

Subject: Re: Estimate from Stepping Stones Marble & Granite LLC

Vicki is on holiday until Tuesday...I don't know the manufacturer for the tile in the Guest Bath. i
can go to the attic over the weekend and check. Those tiles I would be ok with Michael
purchasing, but It scares me for Michael to buy the master bath Carrera marble tile...I'm sure there
arc different 'grades' out there and I want what we have.

I will get back to you....
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On Oct 9, 2014, at 7:01 PM, Robert Caffrey *-’-- wrote:

If you have the tile he will provide everything else. | am going to talk to the tile babe about the price of
the tile. | am going to try to get Mike to buy the tile. | cant tell him right away. He may assume that .
but its hard enough to get them to come back so | just want to get him there. | will work him then. | will

call Vicky tomorrow,

Also what is the name of the tile for both showers before you order it may he can get it. Do you have
any left over in the attic. Its up the stairs to the right. Let me know.

When are you ready for the tile guy

From:

Sent: Thursday, October 09, 2014 3:21 PM

To: Bob Caffrey

Cc: Ike Groff

Subject: Fwd: Estimate from Stepping Stones Marble & Granite LLC

Hi Bob...1 am going to order this tile. | want to make sure you have Michael on the same
page..he is coming to do a repair job in the master bath and guest bath at no charge...right? He
knows this will take 2/3 days to complete (from what | am told due to drying time) He will come
with all the other materials needed.. actually I see the drain extensions are not on this invoice, |
will order those also..but he will bring whatever else 1s needed. . the grout, etc. Also, [ want to
make sure that he can come on consecutive days so this is not a long and drawn out project...ok?
bummed out we have to do this in the first place...everything looks so nice... (

Begin forwarded message:

Subject: Estimate from Stepping Stones Marble & Granite LLC
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Date: October 8, 2014 at 10:35:21 AM EDT

ro: T

Attached 1s the estimate you have requested. If you would like to move forward, I will need to
take payment in full. Let me know if you have any questions. All of the material is in-stock so it
will take about one week to receive everything.

Thanks,
Vicki
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