From: Lesley Gr
Sent: Tue 10/7/2014 2:06:12 PM

Subject: Re: Cc

['ll send him an email. ..

On Oct 7, 2014, at 10:04 AM, Bella Kluil- wrote:

i would need JE approval. Should I ask or you?
On Oct 7, 2014, at 9:53 AM, Lesley Groff <

= Wrote:

That 15 so odd? Why wouldn't they accept vour cc? 1 thought cc's
were accepted anywhere in the world? Bella, should you wire her
money to her account or western union money??

Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 7, 2014, at 9:38 AM. |||} KGN - -

Hello
I have a problem beeing in Munich

They don't accept any cc . No visa , no Amex . Just German cc or cash
Bella I don't know what to do . Now I'm fine . But if I will pay everything like

now - cash is going to end soon.
Should I ask JE ?

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone
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