To: Bella Klei

From:

Sent: Tue 10/7/2014 2:41:25 PM

Subject: Fwd: [JJllihaving problems in Germany w/Money

Begin forwarded message:

From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com=>
Subject: Re: having problems in Germany w/Money
Date: October 7, 2014 at 10:40:36 AM EDT

To: I

3k

On Tue, Oct 7, 2014 at 10:40 AM, [ KENGTGTcNGGGEEEEEE o

great. how much should she send?
On Oct 7, 2014, at 10:39 AM, jeffrey E. <jcevacation(@ gmail.com> wrote:

yes

On Tue, Oct 7, 2014 at 10:08 AM, _wmtct

Please see below from |} -do you want Bella to wire money to
her account? send money via western union? If so, how much?
Please advise.
Hello

I have a problem beeing in Munich

They don't accept any cc . No visa , no Amex . Just German cc or cash

Bella I don't know what to do . Now I'm fine . But if I will pay everything like now -
cash 1s going to end soon.

Should I ask JE ?

please note
The mformation contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute mside information, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthonized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute mside information, and 1s intended only for
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JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
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