
To: 
Cc: Lesley Gro 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent Tue 10/7/2014 3:03:28 PM 
Subject Re: Cc 

wiring... hope you can take out the cash... 
On Oct 7, 2014, at 10:52 AM, 

Thank You so much ! 
And I'm trying to use cc if somewhere it's possible . 

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone 

From: Lcslc 
To: 
Cc: Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: Cc 
Sent: Tue, Oct 7, 2014 2:41:57 PM 

wrote: 

JE has approved Bella to send you $3000..she will be in touch on how she will be doing 
this 
On Oct 7, 2014, at 9:38 AM, ‹ > wrote: 

Hello 
I have a problem beeing in Munich 
They don't accept any cc . No visa , no Amex . Just German cc or cash 
Bella I don't know what to do . Now I'm fine . But if I will pay everything like now - cash 
is going to end soon. 
Should I ask JE ? 

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone 

EFTA_R1_00895378 
EFTA02094520


