
To: Bella Klein Lesley Gro 
From: 
Sent: 
Subject: Re: Cc 

Tue 10/7/2014 3:59:10 PM 

got it 
thank you 

On Tuesday, October 7, 2014 10:44 AM, Bella Klein wrote: 

I will Wire transfer $3,000 to your personal account. Please confirm. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Oct 7, 2014, at 10:41 AM, Lesley Groff JM > wrote: 

JE has approved Bella to send you $3000..she will be in touch on how she will be 
doing this 
On Oct 7, 2014, at 9:38 AM, wrote: 

Hello 
I have a problem beeing in Munich 
They don't accept any cc . No visa , no Amex . Just German cc or cash 
Bella I don't know what to do . Now I'm fine . But if I will pay everything like now -
cash is going to end soon. 
Should I ask JE ? 

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone 
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