
To: Lesley Gr 
Cc: Bella Klei 
From: 
Sent Mon 10/6/2014 10:45:22 PM 
Subject• Re: 

They just told me that 
It's completely fine if You Lesley can write on paper and he will sigh it . That 
hotel is allowed to charge from his cc 
Thank You 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Oct 7, 2014, at 12:00 AM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

> • Does the hotel have a credit card authorization form? Maybe that is what they 
want? 

> Sent from my iPhone 

>> On Oct 6, 2014, at 5:28 PM, wrote: 
>> 
>> Hello 
» I need a proof for hotel that I allowed to use JE ' card that they can charge 
his card for my days 
» Please 
» Help 

>> Sent from my iPhone 
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