
To: Tropical Hole 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: Wed 9/10/2014 1:07:37 PM 
Subject: Re: Car Rental Agreement for 

ok thanks 
I will have her fill out again 

On Sep 10, 2014, at 8:42 AM, Tropical Hotel wrote: 

Dear Lesley, 

We well received the form with credit card information and signature. 

Unfortunately, she will have to fill in a new cc form, because this one had Mrs 
name already printed. 

So please find attached the new form to fill in and return to us. 

Looking forward to hearing from you, 
Best regards, 

Louise 
Administration 

TROPICAL HOTEL 
www.tropicalhotel-stbarth.com 

De: Lesley Groff .111 
Envoye : mardi 9 septem re 
A : Tropical Hotel 
Cc : Bella Klein; 
Objet : Car Rena greemen or 
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