
To: 
From: Robert Caffrey 
Sent: Mon 9/15/2014 6:29:52 PM 
Subject: RE: Gualt stone 

great 

From: 
Sent: Monday, September 15, 2014 2:30 PM 
To: Bob Caffrey 
Subject: Re: Gualt stone 

yes, check is in the mail now. 

minus the $20 

On Sep 15, 2014, at 2:27 PM, Robert Caffrey < wrote: . • 

I never sent it to you. You asked for the total and I gave it to you. Just pay them the total minus the 
twenty two dollars. 

From: 
Sent: 
To: Bob Caffrey 
Subject: Re: Gualt stone 

I never recd this...I am not paying the $22.71 finance charge 

On Sep IS, 2014, at 11:41 AM, Robert Caffrey < wrote: a> 

Here you go. 
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From 
Sent: Monday, September 15, 2014 8:04 AM 
To: Robert Caffrey 
Subject: Re: Gualt stone 

I thought I did. I will check. Can you scan and email the invoice please? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 15, 2014, at 7:54 AM, "Robert Caffrey" > wrote: 

Lesley, 

Did you pay Gault stone the 1,536.89. I got a bill from them. That was the final 
walkway. 

<Groff gualt final bill.pdf> 
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