
To: Bob Caffrey 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Mon 9/15/2014 6:32:25 PM 
Subject Re: Gualt stone 

I am still waiting to pay the guy for the decorative things on our house (can't remember what they 
are called) because I want to know how much Tony is going to charge for the attic fan. Tony is 
having the motor fixed and is to come install on Thurs. I will deduct whatever Tony charges me 
from the total of the roofers invoice 
On Sep 15, 2014, at 2:29 PM, Robert Caffrey < wrote: 

great 

From: 
Sent: Monday, ep em er , : 
To: Bob Caffrey 
Subject: Re: Gualt stone 

yes, check is in the mail now. 
minus the $20 

On Sep 15, 2014, at 2:27 PM, Robert Caffrey wrote: 

I never sent it to you. You asked for the total and I gave it to you. Just pay them the 
total minus the twenty two dollars. 

From: FIFINIIIM 
Sent: Monday, ep em r , 
To: Bob Caffrey 
Subject: Re: Gualt stone 

I never reed this...1 am not paying the $22.71 finance charge 

<=>On Sep 15, 2014, at 11:41 AM, Robert Caffrey wrote: 

Here you go. 

From: 
Sent: Monday, p em er , : 
To: Robert Caffrey 
Subject: Re: Gualt stone 

I thought I did. I will check. Can you scan and email the invoice please? 

EFTA_R1_00698382 
EFTA02095962



Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 15, 2014, at 7:54 AM, "Robert Caffrey" a wrote: 

Did you pay Gault stone the 1,536.89. I got a bill from them. That was the 
final walkway. 

<Groff gualt final bill.pdf> 
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