
To: 
From: 
Sent 
Subject: Re: Gualt stone 

Mon 9/15/2014 12:03:50 PM 

I thought I did. I will check. Can you scan and email the invoice please? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 15, 2014, at 7:54 AM, "Robert Caffrey" wrote: 

Did you pay Gault stone the 1,536.89. I got a bill from them. That was the final 
walkway. 
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