
To: 
From: 
Sent Mon 9/15/2014 12:05:33 PM 
Subject: Re: Jersey framing and invoice 

HiM 

I don't think I will have the panels ready for this weekend, but the shirt is done. Can I drop it off 
to you one day this week? When would be a good time. Thanks. 

Carol 

On September 8, 2014 at 7:14 PlvI t 

Excellent! Thank you so much! :) 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 8, 2014, at 6:49 PM, " 
wrote: 

> wrote: 

The jersey will be done tomorrow. I have calls in to try and speed up the 
drapery. I will try my best and keep you posted. Thanks. 

Carol 

On September 8, 2014 at 12:21 PM 
wrote: 

Hi Carol...we are hoping we will have the curtains and framed shirt by 
Sept. 20th...what do you think? My parents are coming from TX on 
18th and we are having a big party on 20th...would be s00000 very 
nice if we could have the curtains and Cruz shirt hanging ;) Can you 
let me know..thanks, 

On Sep 3, 2014, at 9:14 PM, wrote: 

Hi Leslie! 

Attached is the invoice for the draperies and framed jersey. Is is 
OK for me to put a deposit of $750.00 on your Amex I have on file? 
Also, my master framer said the colors of your jersey are team 

away colors and should not me mixed with the Giants blue. So we 
will sew the jersey down to a red suede matboard and I will put a 
white liner in there to shadowbox the shirt and keep the UV glass off 
of it. 
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I hope this is acceptable, please just confirm. Also, your fabric and 
hardware is on order! Thank you and see you soon. 

Carol 

Carol Tomassetti 
FRAME Creations 
Custom Window Treatments 
Custom Picture Framing 
18 Huntington Plaza 

http://www framecreations. corn/ 
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