To:  Tropical Hote! |

From: Lesley Groff
Sent: Thur 8/11/2014 1:28:51 PM

subject: Re: WELCOME Rental Car for |||} EGIN

Thank you! I will forward the voucher to - and see if they have flights as of yet. Thanks,
Lesley

Sent from my 1Phone

On Sep 11, 2014, at 9:24 AM, "Tropical Hotel" <tropicalhoteli@wanadoo. > wrote:

Dear Lesley,
Thank you for your email.

We well received cc form under Mrs _ name and we have sent it to our
partner Welcome Car Rental.

So please find attached the voucher corresponding.

Also, would you please give us clients’ arrival information when you have it in order our
partner can organize their transfer.

We stay at your disposal for any further information you may need.

Looking forward to hearing from you,
Best regards,

Louise
Administration

TROPICAL HOTEL
www.tropicalhotel-stbarth.com
From Europe

From USA

De : Lesley Groff [mailto:lesley. jee@agmail.com]
Ignvové : mercredi 10 septembre 2014 16:59
A : Tropical Hotel

Cc: i- . Bella Klein
Objet : Hertz Rental Car for
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