To: Bella Klei

From:

Sent: Wed 9/10/2014 1:46:26 PM

Subject: Re: Check to see if we have Hertz credit...

ok, 1'll ask n antoher week

On Sep 10, 2014, at 9:45 AM, bellaklein _ wrote:

not yet
Thank you,
Bella

On Sep 10, 2014, at 9:20 AM [ o'

Bella to please check and see if we rec'd the $873.46 for
Hertz car rental agrmt#008927424
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