
To: 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent Wed 9/10/2014 5:08:00 PM 
Subject: Re: has james ticket been finalized - please advise - thanks 

no cancel he was just asking for emailed confirm 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associate6 Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New 
tel 
fax 
cell 

On Sep 10, 2014, at 1:07 PM, wrote: 

> I have purchased his ticket with Amex and am awaiting the ticket confirm...but 
yes, it is done...if we need to cancel I can still cancel however. 

> On Sep 10, 2014, at 1:06 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

» Richard Kahn 
» HBRK Associates Inc. 
» 575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
» New 
» tel 
» fax 
» cel 
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