
To: Bella Klei 
From: 
Sent: Wed 8/27/2014 3:51:01 PM 
Subject: Re: Citicar recent invoice 

hmm, ok so we actually rec'd decent pricing from citicar 

On Aug 27, 2014, at 11:45 AM, bellaklein wrote: 

> <SHBRK Scann14082711200.pdf> 
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