o Lesiy o

From: Richard Kahn
Sent: Wed 8/17/2014 1:45:04 PM
Subject: Re:

thank you
we are researching now

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc,

On Sep 17, 2014, at 8:33 AM, Lesley Groﬁ"_ wrote:

[ think she 1s paying herself and getting reimbursed, but -wﬂ] need to
confirm__ T have not paid for anything for her. . she has booked all her own
flights...

On Sep 17, 2014, at 8:21 AM, Richard Kahn _wmtc:

Was she paying for al travel on her end or did we put anything on our credit
cards?

From: Lesley Gro R

Date: Wed, 17 Sep 2014 07:56:49 -0400
To: Richard Kahn

Ce: bellaklein —

Subject: Re: FW:

| can help assist in dates she has traveled She does not send me her expense reports.
Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 17, 2014, at 7:26 AM, Richard Kahn <richardkahnl2@gmail.com> wrote:

lee would like a calculation on all out of pocket expenses spent
to date on M air, cars, hotels, etc)

Can you both please help me assemble

Thank you
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From: leffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, 17 Sep 2014 07:20:09 -0400
To: Richard Kahn <richardkahn1? @gmail.com>

if you have not dealt with -jEt, first calcuatle and tell me how much out of pocket
we have spent on her tickets? etc

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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