
To: Bella Klei 
From: Lesley Grroi 
Sent Mon 9/15/2014 3:36:09 PM 
Subject: Re: Amazon 

I can not... 
On Sep 15, 2014, at 11:31 AM, bellaklein wrote: 

Hello, 
Can somebody confirm JE purchases from Amazon? 

09/09/2014 AMAZON SERVICES-KIND866-216-
8.99 

1072 WA 
09/02/2014 AMAZON.COM AMZN.COM/B1LL WA 113.91 
09/02/2014 AMAZON.COM AMZN.COM/BILL WA 341.72 

Thank you, 
Bella 
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