To:  Lesiey crofrl
From: jeffrey E.

Sent: Wed 8/27/2014 4:44:

Subject: Re: Hertz Rental for “

she shoud check otther long term rentals places.  also the price of a used car.

On Wed, Aug 27, 2014 at 12:43 PM, Lesley Gmi_ wrote:

Unfortunately we cannot just extend the car rental for-with Hertz, we must make a
new reservation for Aug. 30-Oct. 2.

We have to aler't-cu go to the Hertz office on August 30th and re-check the vehicle.

MNew prepaid rate from August 30th (around noon local time) to October 2nd (3pm local time)
for same type of vehicle she has, is $4099.20 including all taxes, fees, and mandatory
insurance required.

Just waiting for the new voucher and confirmation. will send to you once | receive.

On Aug 27, 2014, at 8:38 AM, jeftrey E. <jeevacation(i gmail com> wrote:

Les please make 51_111:- has the car thru oct
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