
To: 
From: Jeffrey E. 
Sent Thur 8/28/2014 2:21:22 PM 
Subject: Re: Original Ticket FYI 

See if and new friend 9th 

On Thursday, August 28, 2014, jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

Yes 

On Thursday, August 28, 2014,  wrote: 

FYI--apparently changed her ticket with Turkish Air at some point so now the ticket 
is under Turkish Air control and not Amex control. The only way to get the money back is 
for to go to a Turkish Air office with her ticket and request the refund of 467 Euros. 
It cam=7, back on your card. 

Do you want me to tell his so she can get the money for herself? 
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