
To: Rich Kahn 
Cc: Bella Kleina .
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Tue 8/26/2014 8:48:01 PM 
Subject Re: Reservation Application for Dec. 28-Jan. 7 

ok, thanks. Bella, please do check on this in the morning tomorrow as the rooms in St. Barths are 
few and far between for this time of year...thanks 
On Aug 26, 2014, at 4:46 PM, Richard Kahn < E > wrote: 

best for bella to call VISA to see if there is any issues 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
tel 

i 
fax 
cell l 

On Aug 26, 2014, at 4:39 PM, Lesley Groff ‹ > wrote: 

Visa Card ending in . They do not take Amex 
On Au 26 2014 at 4:38 PM, Richard Kahn 

wrote: 

which card did you give 
we have not received any alerts for a compromised card 
please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 
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On Aug 26, 2014, at 3:15 PM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

Rich, see below... can you help? Or do we 
need to wait for Bella tomorrow? 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Tro ical Hotel" 
> 

Subject: RE: Reservation 
A lication for 

Dec. 28-Jan. 7 
Date: August 26 2014 at 
3 13 06 PM EDT 
To: "'Lesley Groff" 

Dear Lesley, 

Thank you for your email; we have tried to debit the amount of 
4200E from the credit card 
number given. 

Unfortunately, the transaction was denied. 

It is often for amount like this one that happens, we advise you 
to contact your bank in order to 
let them know. 

We are awaiting your green light in order to proceed again. 

We stay at your disposal for any question you may have. 

Best regards, 

Tania 
Reservation 

TROPICAL HOTEL 
www.tro icalhotel-stbarth.com 
From Europe Tel : 

From USA Tel : 

/ Fax : 

/ Fax : 
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 Message dorigine 
De : Lesley Groff a 
Env ' • 15:06 
A: 
Objet : Reservation Application for 

Jan. 7 
Dec. 28-

Please accept below reservation for Dec. 
28, 2014-Jan. 7, 2015 and 
confirm back to me. Thank you, 
Lesley 
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