
To: Rich Kahn[ 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Tue 8/26/2014 7:15:17 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Reservation Application for 

Bella Klein 

Dec. 28-Jan. 7 

Rich, see below... can you help? Or do we need to wait for Bella tomorrow? 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Tropical Hotel" < 
Subject: RE: Reservation Application for 
28-Jan. 7 
Date: August 26, 2014 at 3:13:06 PM EDT 
To: "'Lesley Groff" < 

Dear Lesley, 

Dec. 

Thank you for your email; we have tried to debit the amount of 4200E from the credit card 
number given. 

Unfortunately, the transaction was denied. 

It is often for amount like this one that happens, we advise you to contact your bank in 
order to let them know. 

We are awaiting your green light in order to proceed again. 

We stay at your disposal for any question you may have. 

Best regards, 

Tania 
Reservation 

TROPICAL HOTEL 
www.tro icalhotel-stbarth.com 
From Europe Tel : / Fax : 
From USA Tel : / Faxa 

 Message d'origine 
De : Lesley Groff [mailto 
Env " 15:06 
A: 
Objet : Reservation Application for Dec. 28-Jan. 7 

EFTA_R1_00705083 
EFTA02099607



Please accept below reservation for Dec. 28, 2014-Jan. 7, 2015 and 
confirm back to me. Thank you, Lesley 

EFTA_R1_00705084 

EFTA02099608


