
To: Richard Kahn 
Fran: 
Sent Thur 7/25/2013 3:06:42 PM 
Subject Re: Boat Schedule 

just chccking...do you want me to send the below update to JE? or have you done so already? 
On Jul 25, 2013, at 10:52 AM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

Assume 13-14 weeks from July 22nd for boat being built then 3-4 weeks to ship 
assume 17 weeks from July 22nd to arrive in stt = november 18th 
will update you as i get updates 
please note adam is our contact and his info is below 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Adam Zygowski " <MMM I> 
Date: July 22, 2013 4:32:47 PM EDT 
To: "Richard Kahn" <
Subject: Re: wire 

We received the money at our account. 
The boat should be ready within 13-14 weeks. 
Please let me know about the colors. 
Further please inform how to arrange the bow compartment - we can make place 

for luggage, mattress for sleeping etc. 
What will the boat be used for? 

Best regards 
Adam Zygowski 

Dnia 18-07-2013 o 22:40:03 Richard Kahn <
napisal(a): 
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I have confirmation that the funds will leave our account 
tomorrow somewhere between 9am - 12pm est and then 
hit your account 

I will have color selections by Wednesday next week 

Can you please give me approximate time frames for time 
to build and then ship 

Thank you 

Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 

New York, New York 10022 

SPORTIS S.A. 
84-207 Koleczkowo 
ul. Na Dambnik 22, Bojano Poland 

adam@sportis.com.pl 
www.sportis.com.pl 

http://www.facebook.com/pages/SPORTIS/151189274950385 
http://twitter.coroWsportis_sa 
https://plus.google.cotn/109174365046263030394 

Rejestracja: Sid Rejonowy Gdansk P6!floc Oddzial w Gdafislcu, 
VIII Wydzial Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475, 
kapital zakiadowy: 2.058.170 PLN w caloici oplacony. 
Rcgon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279 
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Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gdatisk-Pohme in Gdansk. 
Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279 
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