From: ellaklein

Sent: Tue 8/5/2014 11:58:50 AM
Subject: Re: To Nataile Prokopchuk

Les, | will call the hotel in 1 hr... Will work it out with them...

Thank you,
Bella

On Aug 5, 2014, at 7:00 .ft?".-’I,_- wrote:

Natalie! [ think I see the problem. This is a VISA card not a MC. | believe |
checked on the wrong card type. Can you please try to run it through again as a
Visa card and see if that works? [l

Sent from my 1Phone

On Aug 5, 2014, at 3:02 AM, Hotel Europe f-:_* wrote:
pear L

Unfortunately our bank doesn't eccept your card for the
prepayment (incorrect CVC?).

Could you please check card details or provide us with another
card.

Looking forward for your answer.

Best regards,

Natalie Prokopchuk
Reservation Department
Hotel Europe

28, Internatsionalnaya Str.
220030 Minsk, Belarus

http://www_hoteleurope.by
reservation@hoteleurope.by
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Or:
Komy: "Hotel Europe" <
OrnpasnenHsie: MNoHe
Tema: To Nataile Prokopchuk

:35:08

HI Natalie...can you please confirm you have received and email back a
confirmation of prepayment on your hotel Letterhead? We
need in order to acquire Mr. Epstein's visa. Thank you, Lesley
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