
To: Bella Klein 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: Mon 7/28/2014 4:11:28 PM 
Subject: Re: Dr. Knapp for JE today 

Karyna was with him...the procedure took place this morning...I am thinking it 
was paid for and you will be reimbursed. 

on Jul 28, 2014, at 12:10 PM, bellaklein C > wrote: 

> will you prepay or i will when inv issued? 
> Thank you, 
> Bella 

> • Tel: 

> • On Jul 28, 2014, at 12:00 PM, Lesley Groff < wrote: 

>> Hi Bella...Jeffrey had a colonscopy this morning,July 28th, with Dr. Knapp. I 
am sending his paperwork to United Healthcare...I know Dr. Knapp take NO 
insurance what so ever...but the office told me to send in this paper work...so I 
am... 
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