To: Karyna Shuliakj . I I

From: Lesley Groff
Sent: Tue 7/29/2014 8:42:13 PM
Subject: Fwd: Confirming Wednesday, July 30th-Freedom Air

This is from larry earlier today...

Begin forwarded message:

From: Lvjet <
Subject: Re: Confirming Wednesday, July 30th-Freedom Air

Date: July 29 2014 at 2:11:27 PM EDT
To: I, I

Hello Joanna,/ AAG. do you have a N Number assigned for us yet? and itinerary you can fwd to Lesley
and myself?

also, pls confirm AAG has our $12,626.40 on account from Freedom Air, International Inc to use for
payment of this trip, and l'l pay the balance on my AMX | provided Dan yesterday?

appears at this point 8:30am departure EAST side NYC pad is good,. and 5:00pm pick up and return to
East side pad is good,. No mention of the Bard collage leg at this time,. never say never with
us,.

#1 Lead Pax: Jeffrey Epstein 175lbs.
#2
#3
#4 Karyna Shuliak

thank you,
Larry Visoski

-----Original Message-—-—
From: GP SIK AAG Flight Ops
To: Larry Visoski <
Cc: GP SIK AAG Flight Ops
Sent; Tue, Jul 29, 2014 10:41 am

Subject: Confirming Wednesday, July 30th-Freedom Air

Hi Larry,
Please confirm tomormow:

0830 East 34" Street — ||| | GINR

Passengers?

_— East 34" Street
Passengers?

Thank you!

Best regards,
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Joanna D'Amico
Flight Operations
ASSOCIATED AIRCRAFT GROUP
A SIKOrsKy Company
42 Griffith Way, Dutchess County

32
. Mew York

Email
www flyvaag.com

Fractional Ownership, Aircraft Management, Charter Services, Aircraft Mainfenance

VIP Platinum Solutions. Experience the Difference.

AAG(tm) is a frademark of Sikorsky Fractional Sales, Inc.

A message to AAG's valued Charter Customers. "By submitting this charter booking
confirmation, Customer agrees to AAG's standard terms and conditions, which can be

found on AAG's website"
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