
July 23, 2014 9:55 AM 

To: 
From: Robert Caffrey 
Sent Thur 7/24/2014 10:49:09 PM 
Subject: RE: Pallet of Granite Delivered/BB Hoop? 

No don't need to pay gault anywhere near that. I will call them tomorrow and get 
exact number 

Ori inal Messa•e 
From: 
Sent: Thursday, July 24, 
To: Bob Caffrey 
Subject: Re: Pallet of Granite Delivered/BB Hoop? 

2014 8:55 AM 

ok, so Northeast builders is Weed and Duryea. 
The BB hoop install was finished yesterday. He made a mess of our driveway with 
his forklift or whatever he was driving in two places. what can you do.Ike tried 
to pound down the areas with a big rock. ...and do you need to pay Gault and 
Danny more than $54,000? how much do you need so I make sure it is in the 
account? 

On Jul 24, 2014, at 8:43 AM, Robert Caffrey wrote: 

> The is the weed and Duryea account in New Canaan. I have to pay Gault 
> for that stone. And Danny for various stuff. 

• Ori•inal Messa•e 
> From: 
> Sent: Wednesday, 
> To: Bob Caffrey 
> Cc: Ike Groff 
> Subject: Re: Pallet of Granite Delivered/BB Hoop? 

> we have $54,000 in the account... 
> What was the $195 to Northeast builders? is that the granite? 
> What did Bob say about the BB hoop install? 

> On Jul 22, 2014, at 5:20 PM, Robert Caffrey 

» Danny will be there on Thursday. I will be up also. Please mark 
>> where you want them. I will have to pay Gault stone and Danny. 
>> 

 Ori•inal Messa•e 
>> From: 
>> Sent: Tuesday, July 22, 2014 5:18 PM 
» To: Bob Caffrey 
» Cc: Ike Groff 
>> Subject: Pallet of Granite Delivered/BB Hoop? 

>> We have a pallet of granite at the front of our driveway on Oenoke 
Ridge.! 

>> Bob was not able to install the entire BB hoop? He has our check 
» though.Gloryana thought they finished, but they did not.Bob needs parts? 

wrote: 
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