
To: Bob Caffrey 
Cc: Ike Grof 
From: 
Sent: Mon 7/21/2014 7:12:23 PM 
Subject: Re: Bankwell 

ah ok on dumpster...and ok on paying danny...would be great if that is it. 
On Jul 21, 20 I 4, at 3:08 PM, Robert Caffrey wrote: 

That was the last dumpster. I have to pay Danny the excavator for the walks and some 
other things. As far as I know that is it. 

From: 
Sent: Monday, July 21, 2014 11:02 AM 
To: Bob Caffrey 
Cc: Ike Groff 
Subject: Bankwell 

What is the below payment for? 

AAA ADVANTAGE CA POS 203-3293878 CT US 028657 $611.51 

Also, what else do you have outstanding when it comes to paying people? Did you 
sign that paperwork for the bank or you still have others to pay? 
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