To: Daphne Wallace | NNGRGDG |
Cc: -““n Rodriguez| |

From:
Sent: Wed 7/16/2014 10:17:05 PM
Subject: Re: JE cell number pls - in case he does not answer ¥75-8100, DW

sorry just seeing this..had te get my son off to baseball..

On Jul l&, 2014, at 5:49% PFM, Daphne Wallace <dlbwallace@gmail.com> wrote:

EFTA_R1_00711028
EFTA02102112



