
To: 
Cc: Bella Klein 
From: 
Sent: Wed 7/9/2014 4:15:46 PM 
Subject: Re: INVOICE (EPSTEIN) 

Anacia Mathurrin 

Hi Anacia...for some reason, the attachment will not open...could you please send 
the actual receipt to: 

Bella Klein 
c/o HERK 

Bella, you will see a charge on Jeffrey's Amex for $77 from Provent. 

Thank you, 

On Jul 9, 2014, at 12:04 PM, Anacia Mathurrin 

> Good afternoon

wrote:

> Her is the invoice you requested for Mr. Epstein's Provent delivery. Thank you 

> • Anacia, 

• Original Message 
• From: HpLaserJet rmailto 
> Sent: Tuesday, July 08, 2014 3:05 PM 
> To: Anacia Mathurrin 
> Subject: INVOICE (EPSTEIN) 

> • This document was digitally sent to you using an HP Digital Sending device. 
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