
To: 
From: 
Sent: 

Subject Re: invoice 

Thur 6/26/2014 11:06:35 AM 

thanks...! the garage charge is for both coats of paint, correct? 

We are hoping you could actually come and paint the 2nd coat either late this 
Friday or sometime on Sat. or Sun this weekend...once we move there will be all the 
items from our current garage in the new garage -I don't want to move it in then 
move it out_makes no sense...Can you possibly please come late in the day tomorrow 
or anytime over the weekend? Please let me know. 

I will get check out to you ASAP...please give me your home address to mail them 
to. 

On Jun 25, 2014, at 11:35 PM, donald perez wrote: 

> Hi Leslie 
> I sent you 2 differents invoices 
> one for the new house 
> the secont for the current house 

> • PD: When I talked with Bob (contractor ) about the shutters He said his guys 
will do the hunging part 
> He knows That ... because I don't know how and my price it is not including 
that job 
> thanks 

> • Best 
> Donald 
> <invoice to ( current house).docx><invoice to ( New 
House).docx> 
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