
Tr o: 
From: 

Steve Al rt 

Sent Fri 7/11/2014 8:30:59 PM 
SubJect Re: Biz Cards TODAY! 

I I 

Send Invoice so I can pass along to accounting please :) 

Sent from my iPhonc 

On Jul 11, 2014, at 4:23 PM, Steve Alpert e > wrote: 

Great. 
Please make sum he comes to 

We are at: 

New York Printing Solutions, Inc. 
209 West 40th St 
3rd Floor 
(Between 6th and 7th, near the corner of 7th Avenue) 
New York, NY 10018 

we moved here last week. 

Thanks, 
Steve 

Steven Alpert 
We Just moved! Here is our new address 
209 West 40th Street 
3rd Floor 
N w Y rk NY 10018 N

Did you know we also specialize in high-end Look books, Catalogs and Pitch books? 

<facebook copy 35 pnq><twitter copy 35 pnq><linkedin copy 35 png><pinterest copy 35 pnq> 
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On Jul I I, 2014, at 4:19 PM, wrote: 

Jojo will come to retrieve cards at 5:15! Thanks 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 11, 2014, at 4:14 PM, Steve Alpert dz: > wrote: 

They are not completed yet. 
We need another 1/2 hour to an hour. 

Thanks. 
Steve 

Steven Alpert 
We just moved! Here is our new address 
209 West 40th Street 
3rd Floor 
New York. NY 10018 

main 

Did you know we also specialize in high-end Look books, Catalogs and Pitch books? 

<facebook copy 
COW .35,ona> 

pria'<twater copy 35.pnq><Iinkedin copy 35 png><pinterest 

On Jul 11, 2014, at 4:13 PM, wrote: 

Can I send my guy to come now? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 11, 2014, at 4:05 PM, Steve Alpert 
wrote: 
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Hi Lesley, 
We close at 6:00pm. 

Best Regards, 
Steve 

Steven Alpert 
We just moved! Here is our new address: 
209 West 40th Street 
3rd Floor 
New York. NY 10018 

main 

Ask us about our high quality signs and posters for your next event. 

On Jul 11, 2014, at 3:39 PM, wrote: 

Hi Steve. How are the cards coming along? What time do you close. I want 
to make sure we are able to pick up today. Thanks! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 11, 2014, at 2:41 PM, Steve Alpert ‹ > 
wrote: 

Between 6th and 7th, closer to 7th. 
All the best, 
Steve 

Steven Alpert 
We just moved! Here is our new address: 
209 West 40th Street 
3rd Floor 
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New York NY 10018 

main 

Ask us about how we can help with your other printing projects. 

On Jul 11, 2014, at 2:01 PM, 
wrote: 

What are your cross streets? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 11, 2014, at 1:58 PM Steve Al ert 
wrote: 

Ok, we will email you when 
they arc completed. 
Thanks, 
Steve 

Steven Alpert 
We just moved! Here is our new address: 
209 West 40th Street 
3rd Floor 
i N w Y rk i NY 10018 

main 

Did you know we also specialize in high-end Look books. Catalogs and Pitch 
books? 
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On Jul 11,2014, at 1:14 PM, 
wrote: 

Perfect! You have my permission to print and charge the Amex. 
Please let me know once they 
are completed and I will have 
them picked up. Please send an 
invoice as well. Thanks! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 11, 2014, at 1:13 PM, Steve Al ert 

in> wrote: 

Hi Lesley, 
OK, let me know 
about this one. 

Thanks, 
Steve 

Steven Alpert 
We just moved! Here is our new address: 
209 West 40th Street 
3rd Floor 

0018 

main 

Did you know we also specialize in high-end Look books, Catalogs 
and Pitch books? 
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<Virgin Islands 
Foundation Africa 
proof new.pdf> 

On Jul 11, 2014, at 12:34 PM, 

wrote: 

Address # is incorrect. It is: 

6100 

Not 100 

The rest is fantastic! I can call you with a CC # once you 
correct the address. 
Thanks. Lesley 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 11, 2014, at 12:27 PM, Steve Al ert 

wrote: 
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Hi 
Lesley, 
Please 
check 
this 
proof 
very 
careful 
y for 
typos 
and 
any 
other 
errors. 
(We 
suggest 
you 
print 
this 
proof 
to a 
laser 
printer 
using 
Adobe 
Acroba 
t at the 
"actual 
size" 
setting. 

If additional changes are required we will send you 
anothe 
r PDF 
proof. 
We are 
not 
pennitt 
ed to 
print 
altered 
artwor 
k 
withou 
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to 
Final 
approv 
ed 
proof. 

Let me know if it is OK to proceed so you can have 
your 
cards 
today. 

We will need a credit card number to charge in 
order 
to get 
started. 

Thanks, 
Steve 

Steven Alpert 
We just moved! Here is our new address: 
209 West 40th Street 
3rd Floor 
New York. NY 10018 

main 

Did you know we also specialize in high-end Look books, 
Catalog 
s and 
Pitch 
books? 
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Best 
Regards 

Steve 

Steven Alpert 
We just moved! Here is our new address: 
209 West 40th Street 
3rd Floor 
11010018 

main 

Ask us about our high quality signs and posters for your next 
event. 
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On Jul 11, 2014, at 10:59 AM, 

wrote: 
Hello! We would like to have 500 business cards 

made 
today 
with 
the 
followi 
ng 
verbiag 
e: 

Director 

VIRGIN ISLANDS FOUNDATION 
AFRICA 

6100 Red Hook Quarter, Suite B-3 
St. Thomas, USVI 00802 

Please put on your basic, but nice 1001b paper stock 
like we 
spoke 
about.. 
.bright 
white 
with 
black 
imprint 
...choo 
se a 
nice 
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font. 
Please 
send 
me a 
mock 
up as 
soon as 
you 
can...w 

would 
like to 
pick 
these 
up 
today. 

Quoted: $143.00 for 500 cards 

Please confirm receipt of this order.. 

Thank you, 
al m
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