to R Kan( I

From: Lesley Groff
Sent: Fri 6/27/2014 3:06:32 PM

Subject: Re: Jeffrey's doctor bill

thanks. will double check. I believe Moskowitz office handles..
On Jun 27, 2014, at 11:05 AM, Richard Kahn *‘4—3" wrote:

bella - can you please handle payment
lesley = it appears that insurance info 1s on invoice so not sure if we need to send
in out of network claim

thank vou

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel

fax

cell

Begin forwarded message:

From: < -

Subject: Jeffrey's doctor bill
Date: June 27, 2014 at 11:02:55 AM EDT
To: Rich Khan <

<photo. JPG>

Sent from my iPhone
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