
To: Joseph Thakuria 
From: 
Sent: Tue 7/1/2014 11:32:39 AM 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey -Please RESPOND ASAP! 

Hi Joe...let me see what Jeffrey would like to do... i will get back to you.. 
On Jun 30, 2014, at 9:49 PM, Joseph Thakuria -‘ 1==> wrote: 

M, I think the cell culture sequencing will need to wait until the next 
batch. This means I have an extra $1k from Jeffrey. Let me know if he 
wants this mailed back or held onto and applied later (I expect the cells be 
sequenced before end of the year). 

I don't personally get any of this money (it only covers sequencing costs) 
and I have no preference. 

Thanks, 
Joe Thakuria 
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