
To: Lesley Ga 
From: Merwin 
Sent Tue 5/27/2014 4:25:26 PM 
Subject: Re: Piano Tuning... 

Thank Les. I called Rich B and he said he would have to do some digging and get back to me. I 
have a feeling he's not going to maybe if it came from you he'll be more willing to help. 

Thanks 

Sent from my iPhone 

On May 27, 2014, at 11:16 AM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

thanks appreciate it...I also appreciate you wanting to run with it, but it scares 
me... 
I don't want anyone to get in trouble over something like piano tuning! not worth 
it. 

On May 27, 2014, at 11:15 AM, Merwin c  wrote: 

Ok. I'll call Rich B 

Sent from my iPhonc 

On May 27, 2014, at 11:13 AM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

yes, please do...this guy comes to the house and is 
familiar with JE's piano...I can email Rich is you prefer... 

• , Merwin 
wrote: 

No we used this company when I was at the 
Carlyle. I would hate to call Rich B for this 
but if you say he only likes the previous 
tuner then I will find out. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On May 27, 2014, at 11:07 AM, Lesley Groff 
wrote: 

EFTA_R1_00716931 
EFTA02104310



is this who Rich Barnett would 
use? JE is very picky... 
On May 27, 2014, at 10:59 AM, 

wrote: 

Hi Les, 
I have Bondi Piano coming 
in on Thursday (May 29) © 
2pm to tune the piano. 

Thanks 

Mecum Deal Cruz 

n ues ay, ay , 014 9:26 AM, Lesley Groff 

great...let me know when you are able to schedule 
the tuner in and 
when it is done 
so I may report to 
JE....thanks! 

On May 27, 2014, at 9:25 AM, M • 

wrote: 

> Ok 
> 
> Thanks 
> 
> Sent from my iPhone 
> 
» On May 27, 2014, at 9:24 AM, Lesley Groff 

>> 
» Morning Merwin...hope you had a nice weekend. 

Jeffrey would like 
his piano tuned 
this week before 
he returns 
home...this is 
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something Rich 
Barnett always 
handled...can you 
please 
coordinate? (I 
think he would 
call Steinway and 
there is a certain 
tuner who always 
comes to our 
house...I'm sure 
Rich can fill you 
in!) 

>> 

» Please confirm back to me. 

» Thanks, Lesley 
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